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Macro backdrop 
December capped a very strong year for markets with further gains in both global and European equites on 

hopes of global growth picking up and trade negotiations seemingly gaining traction. The Europelisted real 

estate sector outpaced wider European equity markets as UK REITs rallied following a decisive election 

result in the UK general election, which saw Boris Johnson's Conservative Party establish a large majority. 

This finally provides some clarity on the path of Brexit, with the UK expected to exit the European Union in 

early 2020 - albeit still leaving an extremely complex trade deal to be negotiated in the year ahead. 

 

December saw a number of larger transactions in European real estate. Further demand for industrial/ 

logistics assets was highlighted by Blackstone making around a £500 million offer for UK REIT Hansteen at 

a 12% premium to its last valuation. In Germany, Deutsche Wohnen sold a portfolio of Berlin apartments for 

around €360 million, 25% above the last valuation. Conversely, shopping centre landlord Intu sold one of its 

prime Spanish assets for €475 million, 10% below book value, highlighting the ongoing pressure on retail 

values, even for good quality centres. 

 

Overall, the funds benchmark index returned 3.0%. 

 

Fund performance and activity 
The fund* delivered similar returns to its index over the month. The strongest performance came from 

London office-focused Helical, which benefited from the UK election result and a more positive outlook for 

rents and values. We also saw positive contributions from Instone and VIB in Germany, as well as Entra and 

Balder in Scandinavia. Conversely, VGP lagged after a strong run and German residential landlord ADO 

properties came under pressure following the surprise decision to pursue a merger with peer Adler. We 

added a new position in GCP Student living via an equity raise to fund further growth. The company is a 

London-focused owner of purpose built student accommodation, a sector that continues to benefit from 

strong supply-demand fundamentals. We also added to our holding in Norwegian office landlord Entra,UK 

diversified large cap British Land and Germany-focused Aroundtown on valuation grounds. These were 

funded with profit taking in some outperformers, along with a sale of our position in TLG in Germany. 

 

Outlook/strategy 
While European growth is likely to remain subdued and some political uncertainty remains, we continue to 

believe real estate's offer of a high income yield with predictable growth characteristics should provide 

attractive returns, particularly given the backdrop of ongoing low interest rates and bond yields. However, 

with low economic growth and structural changes the spread of returns at a property level is likely to remain 

wide in the years ahead, meaning it remains important to be selective. 

 

Following recent strong performance, returns in the year ahead are likely to be driven by income and 

growth, rather than a wider market re-pricing. However, we continue to find opportunities to buy companies 

offering attractive growth stories at valuations which do not appear to reflect the inherent value of their 

assets. More widely, the robust income streams of the European property equities sector are currently 

offering a dividend yield of around 4%, which we forecast to grow by about 4% per annum for the next two 

years. 

 

Source: Janus Henderson Investors, as at 31 December 2019 
  



 

  

* Gross of fees - gross of 5% initial sales charge. Calculated on a bid to bid basis, with gross income reinvested in EUR. 
 
Note: Reference to any specific company or stock is for information purposes only and should not be construed as a recommendation 
to buy or sell the same. 
 
Important information 

Janus Henderson Investors (Singapore) Limited and its affiliates are referred to herein as Janus Henderson Investors. This document 
has been produced based on Janus Henderson Investors’ research and analysis and represents our house view. All the information 
contained in the document is intended for information, illustration or discussion purposes only and should not be relied on for any 
investment decisions or regarded it as a substitute for the exercise of your own judgement. This advertisement has not been reviewed 
by the Monetary Authority of Singapore. 
 
The contents of this document are prepared without consideration to the specific investment objective, financial situation and particular 
needs of any specific person. It does not constitute an advertisement and should not constitute or form part of any offer or solicitation 
to issue, sell, subscribe or purchase any investment in any jurisdiction and do not purport to represent or warrant the outcome of any 
investment strategy, program or product. Any information and views provided herein is subject to change without further notice. None 
of the material, nor its content, nor any copy of it, maybe altered in any way, transmitted to, copied or distributed to any other party, 
without prior express written permission of Janus Henderson Investors. The information contained herein is obtained and / or compiled 
from sources believed to be reliable and current and Janus Henderson Investors do not warrant, guarantee or represent, either
expressly or impliedly, the accuracy, validity or completeness of such information. Janus Henderson Investors or any directors or 
employees of Janus Henderson Investors shall not be liable for any damages arising from any person’s reliance on this information 
and shall not be liable for any errors or omissions (including but not limited to errors or omissions made by third party sources) in this 
information. Unless otherwise indicated, the source for all data is Janus Henderson Investors. 
 
Past performance of any fund, a security, an investment or manager and any opinions, forecasts, assumptions, estimates or valuations 
made are not necessarily indicative of the future or likely performance of the fund, the security, investment or manager. The fund(s) 
may intend to use or invest in financial derivative instruments. An investment in collective investment schemes/funds, and/or other 
investment products is subject to investment risks, including the possible loss of the principal amount invested. The value of the units 
and the income from the funds may fall as well as rise as a result of market and currency fluctuations. Investments in and the rate of 
return for the Fund are not obligations of, deposits in, guaranteed or insured by Janus Henderson Investors or any of its affiliates or 
authorised distributors. 
 
The Singapore Representative of the Janus Henderson Horizon Fund is Janus Henderson Investors (Singapore) Limited and is 
distributed by authorised distributors. The prospectus and Product Highlights Sheet of the Fund is available and may be obtained 
from the Singapore Representative’s office and the authorised distributors’ offices. Investors should read the prospectus and Product 
Highlights Sheet before deciding whether to invest in the units of the Fund. 
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